
ITEM# ASSESSMENT# STATUS SALE PRICE

1 010590215-5 REDEEMED

2 010590216-6 REDEEMED

3 010590667-0 REDEEMED

4 010590668-1 REDEEMED

5 010591506-1 REDEEMED

6 010591975-1 SOLD $4,111.00

7 010593180-5 OFF SALE

8 010593818-9 REDEEMED

9 010593932-8 REDEEMED

10 010593933-9 REDEEMED

11 010594077-9 REDEEMED

12 010594084-5 NO BID

13 010594551-0 NO BID

14 010594595-0 NO BID

15 010594977-2 SOLD $864.00

16 010595096-9 REDEEMED

17 010595763-8 SOLD $3,564.00

18 010595764-9 SOLD $864.00

19 010596329-3 REDEEMED

20 010596445-4 NO BID

21 010596485-0 REDEEMED

22 010598112-9 NO BID

23 010598177-8 SOLD $1,064.00

24 010598354-1 SOLD $864.00

25 010598413-1 SOLD $3,464.00

26 010598795-6 REDEEMED

27 010598969-7 SOLD $764.00

28 010599112-2 NO BID

29 010630631-0 REDEEMED

30 010630782-3 REDEEMED

31 010631114-3 REDEEMED

32 010631293-1 REDEEMED
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33 010632304-1 REDEEMED

34 010632438-9 NO BID

35 010633183-1 SOLD $2,164.00

36 010633777-8 REDEEMED

37 010634554-6 REDEEMED

38 010635807-8 REDEEMED

39 010636656-1 SOLD $2,164.00

40 010636966-1 NO BID

41 010637014-4 REDEEMED

42 010637667-4 REDEEMED

43 010637693-7 SOLD $764.00

44 010638452-9 REDEEMED

45 010638783-8 NO BID

46 010639797-4 NO BID

47 010640554-5 SOLD $764.00

48 010640669-6 REDEEMED

49 010640782-4 NO BID

50 010640992-7 REDEEMED

51 010641008-2 NO BID

52 010641135-3 REDEEMED

53 010650827-3 REDEEMED

54 010650894-3 REDEEMED

55 010650895-4 REDEEMED

56 010651696-4 REDEEMED

57 010651947-1 SOLD $764.00

58 010653209-4 NO BID

59 010653466-9 REDEEMED

60 010653580-8 REDEEMED

61 010653798-9 SOLD $764.00

62 010653945-5 REDEEMED

63 010655317-4 REDEEMED

64 010655318-5 REDEEMED
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65 010655790-7 REDEEMED

66 010656513-7 SOLD $2,064.00

67 010657338-9 REDEEMED

68 010657708-0 SOLD $2,164.00

69 010658754-4 REDEEMED

70 010658780-7 REDEEMED

71 010659368-2 REDEEMED

72 010659430-4 SOLD $1,164.00

73 010659679-3 SOLD $764.00

74 010659680-3 SOLD $764.00

75 010659730-5 REDEEMED

76 010659817-1 REDEEMED

77 010659928-8 REDEEMED

78 010660908-4 SOLD $764.00

79 010660990-7 REDEEMED

80 010661389-8 REDEEMED

81 010661462-0 SOLD $764.00

82 010661635-0 SOLD $764.00

83 010680408-1 REDEEMED

84 010680459-7 NO BID

85 010680789-5 NO BID

86 010680815-5 REDEEMED

87 010690093-0 SOLD $1,164.00

88 010691054-8 SOLD $964.00

89 010691424-9 REDEEMED

90 010691955-2 REDEEMED

91 010692075-0 REDEEMED

92 010692231-4 REDEEMED

93 010692232-5 REDEEMED

94 010693192-5 REDEEMED

95 010693392-9 SOLD $964.00

96 010694323-0 SOLD $2,164.00
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97 010694324-1 SOLD $1,964.00

98 010695044-1 REDEEMED

99 010695580-8 NO BID

100 010695669-6 NO BID

101 010695754-9 NO BID

102 010695935-6 SOLD $3,064.00

103 010696262-4 SOLD $1,964.00

104 010696510-8 REDEEMED

105 010697381-1 REDEEMED

106 010697911-0 NO BID

107 010700204-4 NO BID

108 010700216-5 NO BID

109 010700225-3 NO BID

110 010700326-1 REDEEMED

111 010700552-8 REDEEMED

112 010700673-4 REDEEMED

113 010700762-1 REDEEMED

114 010701087-8 NO BID

115 010701096-6 REDEEMED

116 010701330-7 NO BID

117 010701627-6 REDEEMED

118 010701647-4 SOLD $764.00

119 010702095-8 NO BID

120 010702329-0 NO BID

121 010702504-1 REDEEMED

122 010702555-7 REDEEMED

123 010702577-7 REDEEMED

124 010702643-3 REDEEMED

125 010702672-9 SOLD $1,864.00

126 010702716-6 SOLD $1,900.00

127 010702865-7 REDEEMED

128 010703040-1 SOLD $1,964.00
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129 010703181-5 REDEEMED

130 010703245-0 REDEEMED

131 010703384-2 SOLD $1,964.00

132 010703417-9 SOLD $2,264.00

133 010703535-2 REDEEMED

134 010703578-1 REDEEMED

135 010703675-5 REDEEMED

136 010703762-0 REDEEMED

137 010703914-1 SOLD $764.00

138 010703988-8 REDEEMED

139 010704016-3 REDEEMED

140 010704039-4 REDEEMED

141 010704122-5 NO BID

142 010704326-3 REDEEMED

143 010704369-2 REDEEMED

144 010704601-1 REDEEMED

145 010730237-7 SOLD $764.00

146 010731660-8 REDEEMED

147 010731744-1 REDEEMED

148 010732076-4 REDEEMED

149 010732077-5 REDEEMED

150 010732682-1 REDEEMED

151 010733022-8 REDEEMED

152 010733266-2 SOLD $3,764.00

153 010733674-7 REDEEMED

154 010734639-9 SOLD $1,400.00

155 010734662-9 REDEEMED

156 010734865-6 SOLD $764.00

157 010735093-8 SOLD $764.00

158 010735288-8 SOLD $764.00

159 010735561-4 SOLD $3,000.00

160 010735630-3 SOLD $1,364.00
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161 010735680-8 REDEEMED

162 010736063-4 REDEEMED

163 010736454-4 SOLD $2,564.00

164 010736578-3 SOLD $1,964.00

165 010736705-1 REDEEMED

166 010738217-3 NO BID

167 010738465-0 NO BID

168 010738611-5 REDEEMED

169 010738612-6 REDEEMED

170 010739385-4 SOLD $3,100.00

171 010739643-7 REDEEMED

172 010750148-2 REDEEMED

173 010750419-7 SOLD $2,450.00

174 010750498-8 SOLD $2,700.00

175 010751456-3 SOLD $2,264.00

176 010751457-4 SOLD $964.00

177 010751692-9 SOLD $764.00

178 010751804-4 NO BID

179 010751834-1 NO BID

180 010751920-5 REDEEMED

181 010752468-7 NO BID

182 010752488-5 REDEEMED

183 010752800-3 REDEEMED

184 010753022-0 REDEEMED

185 010753460-2 REDEEMED

186 010753694-7 REDEEMED

187 010753904-7 REDEEMED

188 010754083-8 REDEEMED

189 010754227-2 REDEEMED

190 010754234-8 REDEEMED

191 010754378-5 SOLD $2,564.00

192 010754485-8 REDEEMED
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193 010754499-1 SOLD $2,764.00

194 010754626-9 SOLD $3,800.00

195 010754629-2 SOLD $3,364.00

196 010755537-5 REDEEMED

197 010755538-6 REDEEMED

198 010755678-9 REDEEMED

199 010755814-5 REDEEMED

200 010756405-2 REDEEMED

201 010756881-8 REDEEMED

202 010756923-3 REDEEMED

203 010757102-1 REDEEMED

204 010757262-2 REDEEMED

205 010757881-1 REDEEMED
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